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Stock 
Number Unit Description

Approved Brand                                          
(Manufacturer's Product 

Code)

Estimated Number of Servings Bidder Bidder
Terms

Bidder
Brand

 Manufacturer's 
Product Code Pack Size Estimated Servings 

Per Case
Cost Per 

Servings/Pounds          Cost Per Case

Required 
Number            

 of                
 Cases

Extended 
Total       
Cost

Comments
LEAD TIME FROM 

ORDER (IN 
WEEKS) 

Menu Planning Notes

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE 
FOLLOWING 

SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT 
CURRENT AWARDS.  ALL 

PACK SIZES WILL BE 
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED 

AND EVALUATED.

ALL SHIP LOTS 
ARE IN CASES.

Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS 
will accept an approved 
equal (1) as long as it 
meets the bid specification 
and (2) tested and 
approved through MSCS's 
Sample Submission 
Process.

1401 SERVINGS

Taco Seasoned Chopped Chicken -  Frozen, fully cooked taco 
seasoned chopped chicken. Produced from dark chicken 
portions. CN label or crediting statement required for a 
serving size 2 oz. meat/meat alternate.

Approximate Pack: 160 Servings per case.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

No Approved Brand 

5,600 Tyson
5000 lbs per drop 

location
TYSON 10000043537 240 / 2 oz 240 0.3668 $88.02 23                             2,053.80$                  2 WEEKS

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE APPROVED

1401 SERVINGS

Taco Seasoned Chopped Chicken -  Frozen, fully cooked taco 
seasoned chopped chicken. Produced from dark chicken 
portions. CN label or crediting statement required for a 
serving size 2 oz. meat/meat alternate.

Approximate Pack: 160 Servings per case.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

No Approved Brand 

5,600 Sysco Memphis LLC NET30 Tyson 10000043537 
(7253755)

6/5# 960 0.101875 $97.80 6                               570.50$                     New Item 5 weeks

NO AWARD

SAMPLE SENT SAMPLE 
APPROVED

CASE DOES NOT YIELD 960 
SERVINGS. SERVINGS PER CASE 

SHOULD REFLECT 240. 240 
SERVINGS SHOULD YIELD 23 

CASES.  23 TIMES 97.80 = 
$2,249.40

1401 SERVINGS

Taco Seasoned Chopped Chicken -  Frozen, fully cooked taco 
seasoned chopped chicken. Produced from dark chicken 
portions. CN label or crediting statement required for a 
serving size 2 oz. meat/meat alternate.

Approximate Pack: 160 Servings per case.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

No Approved Brand 

5,600 Proview Foods net 20 Proview Foods 28802 3.00 oz 106 0.941603774 $99.81                               53  $                 5,272.98 
6 pallet minimum 

ship
2 weeks

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE APPROVED

1402 SERVINGS

Mesquite Glazed Chicken Thigh -  Frozen, fully cooked 
mesquite glazed chicken. Smoky and slightly sweet glaze. 
Produced from dark chicken thighs. Serving size must meet a 
minimum of 2 oz. meat/meat alternate for the Child Nutrition 
Program. 

Approximate Pack: 98 Serving per case.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

No Approved Brand 

5,390 Tyson
5000 lbs per drop 

location
TYSON 10000044196 78 / 3.7 oz 78 1.0842 $84.57 69                             5,844.00$                  2 WEEKS

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE APPROVED
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Stock 
Number Unit Description

Approved Brand                                          
(Manufacturer's Product 

Code)

Estimated Number of Servings Bidder Bidder
Terms

Bidder
Brand

 Manufacturer's 
Product Code Pack Size Estimated Servings 

Per Case
Cost Per 

Servings/Pounds          Cost Per Case

Required 
Number            

 of                
 Cases

Extended 
Total       
Cost

Comments
LEAD TIME FROM 

ORDER (IN 
WEEKS) 

Menu Planning Notes

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18

1402 SERVINGS

Mesquite Glazed Chicken Thigh -  Frozen, fully cooked 
mesquite glazed chicken. Smoky and slightly sweet glaze. 
Produced from dark chicken thighs. Serving size must meet a 
minimum of 2 oz. meat/meat alternate for the Child Nutrition 
Program. 

Approximate Pack: 98 Serving per case.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

No Approved Brand 

5,390 Sysco Memphis LLC NET30 Tyson 10000044196 
(7258127)

1/23# 98 0.958877551 $93.97 55                             5,168.35$                  New Item 5 weeks

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE APPROVED

1403 SERVINGS

Boneless Chicken Pieces w/ Grilled Marks -  Frozen, fully 
cooked, boneless, skinless, grilled chicken strip pieces with 
marks. Produced from dark chicken meat portions. Serving 
size must meet 2 oz. meat/meat alternate for the Child 
Nutrition Program.

Approximate Pack: 160 servings per case.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

No Approved Brand 

5,600
Pilgrim's Pride 
Corporation

Net 30 Gold Kist 1260 6/5# 206 0.232524272 $47.90 27                             1,302.14$                  14 days

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE APPROVED

1403 SERVINGS

Boneless Chicken Pieces w/ Grilled Marks -  Frozen, fully 
cooked, boneless, skinless, grilled chicken strip pieces with 
marks. Produced from dark chicken meat portions. Serving 
size must meet 2 oz. meat/meat alternate for the Child 
Nutrition Program.

Approximate Pack: 160 servings per case.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

No Approved Brand 

5,600 Tyson
5000 lbs per drop 

location
TYSON 10167020928 168 / 2.85 oz 168 0.6932 $116.46                               33  $                 3,882.00 2 WEEKS

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE APPROVED

1403 SERVINGS

Boneless Chicken Pieces w/ Grilled Marks -  Frozen, fully 
cooked, boneless, skinless, grilled chicken strip pieces with 
marks. Produced from dark chicken meat portions. Serving 
size must meet 2 oz. meat/meat alternate for the Child 
Nutrition Program.

Approximate Pack: 160 servings per case.

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

No Approved Brand 

5,600 Sysco Memphis LLC NET30 Tyson 10167020928 
(3009851)

6/5# 160 0.80875 $129.40 35                             4,529.00$                  New Item 5 weeks
SAMPLE SENT 

SAMPLE APPROVED

1404 SERVINGS

Chicken Meatballs -  Frozen, fully cooked, chicken meatballs 
made from ground chicken. No artificial colors, flavor or 
preservatives. Three meatballs provide 2 oz. meat/meat 
alternate. 

Approximate Pack: 58 Servings per case. 

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

No Approved Brand 

4,350 Tyson
5000 lbs per drop 

location
TYSON 10197770328 58 / 2.76 oz 58 0.6824 $39.58                               75  $                 2,968.50 2 WEEKS

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE APPROVED

1404 SERVINGS

Chicken Meatballs -  Frozen, fully cooked, chicken meatballs 
made from ground chicken. No artificial colors, flavor or 
preservatives. Three meatballs provide 2 oz. meat/meat 
alternate. 

Approximate Pack: 58 Servings per case. 

Ship Lot: 200 Cases

No Approved Brand 

4,350 Sysco Memphis LLC NET30 Tyson 10197770328 
(1541871)

2/5# 58 0.77862069 $45.16 75                             3,387.00$                  New Item 5 weeks
SAMPLE SENT 

SAMPLE APPROVED

Page 2



Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
2025 Summer Feeding Commercial Food Items Bid

Frozen By The Serving 

Page 3

Stock 
Number Unit Description

Approved Brand                                          
(Manufacturer's Product 

Code)

Estimated Number of Servings Bidder Bidder
Terms

Bidder
Brand

 Manufacturer's 
Product Code Pack Size Estimated Servings 

Per Case
Cost Per 

Servings/Pounds          Cost Per Case

Required 
Number            

 of                
 Cases

Extended 
Total       
Cost

Comments
LEAD TIME FROM 

ORDER (IN 
WEEKS) 

Menu Planning Notes

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18

1405 SERVINGS

Chicken Ham and Cheese Sandwich -  IW, Frozen, chicken 
ham & cheese on whole grain hoagie bun. Fully cooked, sliced 
chicken ham. Slices to be no more that 1/2 oz. Thaw and 
serve or heated sandwich. CN label or crediting statement  
required for a serving size 2 oz. meat/meat alternate and 2 
oz. of grain equivalent for the Child Nutrition Program.

Approximate Pack: 45 servings per case.

Ship Lot: 400 Cases

No Approved Brand 

5,625 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID #DIV/0! #DIV/0! #DIV/0! NO BID

1409 SERVINGS

Turkey Ham, All Natural, Smoked and Sliced -  Frozen, fully 
cooked, sliced turkey ham. Slices to be no more that 1/2 oz.   
Produced from turkey thigh meat portions, smoked and 
cured. Sliced.  CN label or crediting statement  required. 
Approximately 5.22 oz. sandwich provides 2.00 oz. equivalent 
meat/meat alternate.

Approximate Pack: 45 servings per case.

Ship Lot: 400 Cases

No Approved Brand 

10,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID #DIV/0! #DIV/0! #DIV/0! NO BID

1664 SERVINGS

Grab and Go, Deli Meal, Turkey Pepperoni Meal  - To 
contain turkey Pepperoni, mozzarella cheese, marinara sauce 
and whole grain flat bread rounds. Entire serving must meet 
a minimum of 2.0 meat/meat alternative and 2.0 oz Grain 
Equivalents for the Child Nutrition Program.  Approximate 
pack: 48 - 5.43 oz servings per case.                                                                             

Ship Lot: 650 Cases 

TASTY BRANDS 10102

31,200 Tasty Brands 1%10, net 20 Tasty Brands 10102 48/5.58 oz 48 1.6325 $78.36 650                           50,934.00$               5000 lb minimum 
ship

2 wks AWARD

1703 SERVING

Fruit Slush Pouch, Frozen- Each serving to meet ½ cup eq of 
fruit per USDA child nutrition program guidelines. Must be 
made with 100% fruit juice and no added sugars. Homeade 
Italian Ice that is intended to be eaten partially frozen and 
should include a variety of flavors. Crediting statement or CN 
label required.  Strawberry 

Ship Lot: 300 Cases 

Lindy's Froot Juice 

25,000 Sysco Memphis LLC NET30 Lindy's Froot Juice FRP0175 (7088326) 
Fruit Punch

90/4.4oz 90 0.361111111 $32.50 278                           9,027.78$                  

New Items & All 
same Price 

TAN0250 (7127288) 
Tangerine - 

BCH0106 (7088212) 
Black Cherry 

5 weeks
AWARD

(STRAWBEERY ONLY)
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Dry By The Serving

Stock 
Number Unit Description Approved Brand                                          

(Manufacturer's Product Code)

Estimated Number of 
Servings Bidder Bidder

Terms
Bidder
Brand

 Manufacturer's 
Product Code Pack Size Estimated 

Servings Per Case Cost Per Servings         Cost Per Case

Required 
Number            

 of                
 Cases

Extended 
Total       
Cost

Comments
LEAD TIME 

FROM ORDER (IN 
WEEKS) 

Menu Planning Notes

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18

Bid Submissions That Deviate From What Is Being 
Requested In The Specifications Below Will Be 

Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE 
FOLLOWING SPECIFICATIONS 
REFLECT CURRENT AWARDS.  

ALL PACK SIZES WILL BE 
THOROUGHLY CONSIDERED 

AND EVALUATED.

ALL SHIP 
LOTS ARE 
IN CASES.

Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, 

MSCS will accept an 
approved equal (1) as 

long as it meets the bid 
specification and (2) 
tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process.

1190 SERVING

Juice, Fruit Punch, 6.75 oz. 100% pure juice. With Calcium, No 
Sugar Added, Fortified W/ Vitamins A, C and E. Shelf Stable for 
12 Months, Straw attached. Fruit Content Equal To 3/4 Cup for 
the Child Nutrition program.  Approximate pack is 40 servings. 

Ship Lot:  325 Cases

Apples & Eve 84512
Ardmore Farms 62042

13,000 Sysco Memphis LLC NET30 Ardmore 62042 (7846530) 40/6.75oz 40 0.4115 $16.46 325 $5,349.50 3 weeks NO AWARD

1190 SERVING

Juice, Fruit Punch, 6.75 oz. 100% pure juice. With Calcium, No 
Sugar Added, Fortified W/ Vitamins A, C and E. Shelf Stable for 
12 Months, Straw attached. Fruit Content Equal To 3/4 Cup for 
the Child Nutrition program.  Approximate pack is 40 servings. 

Ship Lot:  325 Cases

Apples & Eve 84512
Ardmore Farms 62042

13,000 KDP-Motts Net 30 Motts 10003393 4/8/6.75 oz 32 0.23  $                    7.36 406.25 $2,990.00 1

AWARD

SAMPLE SENT 
SAMPLE 

APPROVED

1193 SERVING

Juice, Grape, 6.75 oz. 100% Juice, With Calcium, No Sugar 
Added, Fortified W/ Vitamin C. Shelf Stable for 12 Months, 
straw Attached. Fruit Content Equal To 3/4 Cup  for the Child 
Nutrition program.  Approximate pack is 40 servings.                                                                            

Ship Lot: 325 Cases 

Apple & Eve 84518 
Ardmore Farms 62043

13,000 Sysco Memphis LLC NET30 Ardmore 62043 (7846542) 40/6.75oz 40 0.443 $17.72 325 $5,759.00 3 weeks

NO AWARD

Ardmore Farms 62043 
will be removed as an 

approved brand 
because we are looking 

for 100% Grape juice 
and not a blend.

1193 SERVING

Juice, Grape, 6.75 oz. 100% Juice, With Calcium, No Sugar 
Added, Fortified W/ Vitamin C. Shelf Stable for 12 Months, 
straw Attached. Fruit Content Equal To 3/4 Cup  for the Child 
Nutrition program.  Approximate pack is 40 servings.                                                                            

Ship Lot: 325 Cases 

Apple & Eve 84518 
Ardmore Farms 62043

13,000 KDP-Motts Net 30 Motts 10003392 4/8/6.75 oz 32 0.23  $                    7.36 406.25 $2,990.00 1

NO AWARD

 Sample sent but could 
not be tested because 
it is a grape blend and 
not 100% Grape Juice 

Dry-Servings Page 4



Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
2025 Summer Feeding Commercial Food Items Bid

Dry By The Serving

Stock 
Number Unit Description Approved Brand                                          

(Manufacturer's Product Code)

Estimated Number of 
Servings Bidder Bidder

Terms
Bidder
Brand

 Manufacturer's 
Product Code Pack Size Estimated 

Servings Per Case Cost Per Servings         Cost Per Case

Required 
Number            

 of                
 Cases

Extended 
Total       
Cost

Comments
LEAD TIME 

FROM ORDER (IN 
WEEKS) 

Menu Planning Notes

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18

1193 SERVING

Juice, Grape, 6.75 oz. 100% Juice, With Calcium, No Sugar 
Added, Fortified W/ Vitamin C. Shelf Stable for 12 Months, 
straw Attached. Fruit Content Equal To 3/4 Cup  for the Child 
Nutrition program.  Approximate pack is 40 servings.                                                                            

Ship Lot: 325 Cases 

Apple & Eve 84518 
Ardmore Farms 62043

13,000 KDP-Motts Net 30 Motts 10003394 4/8/6.75 oz 32 0.23  $                    7.36 406.25 $2,990.00 1

NO AWARD

 Sample sent but could 
not be tested because 

it is Apple Juice and not 
100% Grape Juice 

1699 SERVING

Fruit Slush Pouch, Mango Peach- Each serving to meet ½ cup 
eq of fruit per USDA child nutrition program guidelines. Must 
be made with 100% fruit juice and no added sugars. Intended 
to be eaten partially frozen at a slush consistency and should 
include a variety of flavors. Crediting statement or CN label 
required.  

Ship Lot: 300 Cases 

Cool Tropics 14506

25,000 Cool Tropics Cool Tropics 14506 4 oz. 60 0.369  $                  22.15 416.6666667 $9,229.17

28 pallets (2,240 
cases) truckload 

pricing @ $22.15/cs. 
14 pallets (1,120 

cases) minimum @ 
$22.75/cs.

3 AWARD

Dry-Servings Page 5



Memphis-Shelby County Schools (MSCS)
2025 Summer Feeding Commercial Food Items Bid

Dry By The Case

Stock 
Number Unit Description

Approved Brand                                          
(Manufacturer's Product 

Code)

Estimated Number 
of Servings Bidder Bidder

Terms
Bidder
Brand

 Manufacturer's 
Product Code Pack Size

Estimated 
Servings/Pounds Per 

Case

Cost Per 
Servings/Pounds          Cost Per Case

Required 
Number            

 of                
 Cases

Extended 
Total       
Cost

Comments
LEAD TIME FROM 

ORDER (IN 
WEEKS) 

Menu Planning Notes

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5 Column 6 Column 7 Column 8 Column 9 Column 10 Column 11 Column 12 Column 13 Column 14 Column 15 Column 16 Column 17 Column 18

Bid Submissions That Deviate From 
What Is Being Requested In The 

Specifications Below Will Be 
Considered A Non Acceptable Vendor 

Response.

PACK SIZES FOR THE FOLLOWING 
SPECIFICATIONS REFLECT 

CURRENT AWARDS.  ALL PACK 
SIZES WILL BE THOROUGHLY 

CONSIDERED AND EVALUATED.

Items listed are Pre-
Approved Brands, MSCS 
will accept an approved 

equal (1) as long as it 
meets the bid 

specification and (2) 
tested and approved 

through MSCS's Sample 
Submission Process.

ALL SHIP LOTS 
ARE IN CASES.

1111 CASE

Pickles, Dill Hamburger, Sliced -  
Each jar is securely sealed to 
prevent leakage and contains a 
resealable lid for each jar.  Contains 
approx. 1125 smooth cut slices. 
packed to USDA Grade A.        
Approximate Pack: 6-5.75 pound 
plastic pickle jars/case

Ship Lot: 250 Cases

GFS/Bay Valley 
127/12822891393
Cajun Chef 
Heinz 5218904
Bay Valley 
12746771170

250 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID #DIV/0! #DIV/0! #DIV/0! NO BID
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